
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
TO:         Office of the Chief 
 
FROM:   Det. Sgt. John Dunn 
 
SUBJECT:  Annual Crime Analysis Report for 2008 
 
The annual report includes general information on Part 1 and selected Part 2 crimes 
reported and investigated by the Guilford Police Department. The report also includes 
information on motor vehicle enforcement, accidents, and alarm cases investigated by 
this agency from January 1st, 2008 to December 31st, 2008.  A comparison on all 
information is also listed for the previous year. 
 
Calls for Service 
 
During 2008 the Guilford Police Department received 13,223 calls for service. Of theses 
calls the following information has been formulated for your review. There were (736) 
criminal arrests. 
 
Burglary Cases 
 
There were a total of fifty-nine (59) burglaries reported during this period.  The majority 
of which were residential in nature.  During the same period for 2007 there were fifty two 
(52) reported burglaries in the jurisdiction.  This was a 13% increase from the previous 
year. 
 
Criminal Mischief Cases: 
 
There were a total of two hundred and forty-eight (248) criminal mischief complaints 
reported during this period.  The majority of which were private property and or mailbox 
damage.  During the same period for 2007 there were three hundred and thirty-eight 
(338) cases reported.  This was a 27% reduction from the previous year. 
 
 
 
 
 



 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Larceny Cases: 
 
There were a total of three hundred and twelve (312) larceny complaints filed during this 
period. The majority of which were classified as general larceny in nature.   During the 
same period for 2007 there were two hundred and ninety-two (292) cases reported. This 
was a 7% increase from the previous year. 
 
Motor Vehicle Enforcement 
 
There were a total of (3,214) motor vehicle violations investigated during this period. 
During the same period for 2007 there were (3,323) cases investigated. This was a 3% 
reduction from the previous year. 
 
There were 41 DWI arrests in 2008 and 48 DWI arrests in 2007 a 14% reduction. 
 
Motor Vehicle Accidents 
 
There were a total of (682) motor vehicle accidents investigated during this period. Three 
(3) of these were fatal.   During the same period for 2007 there were 765 motor vehicle 
accidents investigated, none of which were fatal. This was a 11% reduction from the 
previous year. 
 
During this reporting period there were 202 child safety seats installed by officers of this 
department. 
 
Narcotics/Drugs 
 
There were a total of fifty-six (56) drug related cases investigated during this period. 
During the same period for 2007 there were (58) cases investigated.  This was a  3% 
reduction from the previous year. 
 
Sex Crimes Cases: 
 
There were a total of eleven (11) sex crime related cases investigated during this period.   
During the same period for 2007 there were fourteen (14) cases investigated. This was a 
21% reduction from the previous year. 



 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Robbery Cases:  
 
There were a total of three (3) robberies cases investigated during this period.  During the 
same period for 2007 there were two (2) cases investigated.  This was a 50% increase 
from the previous year. 
 
Alarms All types 
 
The department responded to a total of 1,700 alarms during this period.  During the same 
period for 2007 the department responded to a total of 1,550 alarms. This was a 9% 
reduction from the previous year. 
 
Murder Cases: 
 
None reported 
 
Arson Cases: 
 
None reported 
 
 
Sincerely, 
 
Det. Sgt. John Dunn #64 
Detective Unit Supervisor 


